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Zoom: https://tinyurl.com/yvhp8fzf

Interior of the Gynaecology Clinic, Maison de Verre (Pierre Chareau 1928–32). Photograph Emma Cheatle, 2008. With permission of Robert Rubin.

The project seeks to reveal all the herit-
age present in the territory of Roquetas 
de mar in order to give it an important 
place in the project “second life” To get 
this target, we propose an extended 
definition of patrimony that allows to 
highlight different existing elements 
such as heritage, local materials, daily 
practices, Poniente’s landscape, etc. 
Then we introduced those patrimonials 
elements in order to develop a city that 
can evolve and adapt itself according to 
the economic, demographic or ecologi-
cal pressures that the territory has to 
face.

Graduated from Nantes and Granada’s 
high school, we use to work together on 
competition and architectural project 
that question the notions of patrimony, 
materiality, time, landscape or produc-
tion in the city. We especially worked 
with Carlos and Carmen to respond to 
europan 16 because they work (or they 
have worked) on subjects in relation 
with Roquetas del Mar like food produc-
tion in the city and immigration.

Second Life
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